3/14/24,12:18 PM Gmail - RE: Thomas Price G&C

M Gmall Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
RE: Thomas Price G&C

7 messages

Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net> Wed, Nov 29, 2023 at 2:42 PM

To: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>, Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>, "leslie@byramlaw.com"
<leslie@byramlaw.com>, "Jon A. Blongewicz" <blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>

David-

Tom Price’s Medical Insurance through Proctor and Gamble (Part C) has a balance due of
$536.00. That was being paid as an automatic payment on his Discover Card which has been
cancelled, so his premiums stopped getting paid. The Judge has ordered and allowed you to pay
all his Medical Insurance/bills at the last hearing as | recall.

If this is not paid by the end of the month (November 30”‘), Mr. Price will likely lose his Medical
insurance coverage for 2024 and possibly for future years.

Let us know if we can help in any way.

Dan C. Sanders

MONACO, SANDERS, RACINE, & POWELL, L.L.C.
8700 State Line Road, Suite 110

Leawood, Kansas 66206

Main: (816) 523-2400, ext. 2

Direct dial: (816) 209-6837

Fax: (816) 942-0006

dsanders@kcattorneys.net

This message is from the offices of Monaco, Sanders, Racine & Powell, L.C. and is intended only for the addressee. The information
contained in this message is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside or non-public information under
federal or state securities laws and is intended only for the use of the addressee. Unauthorized forwarding, printing, copying,
distributing, or using of such information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you are not the addressee, please promptly

delete this message and notify the sender of the delivery error by return e-mail or you may call us at (816) 523-2400.
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Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net> Wed, Nov 29, 2023 at 2:47 PM
To: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>, Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>, "leslie@byramlaw.com"
<leslie@byramlaw.com>, "Jon A. Blongewicz" <blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>

David-

| don’t have one either and | don’t think Jeff does either since it has been on auto pay for last 6 years or so
as | understand.

Any suggestions as to how we find out? Il ask Jeff the same question.

Dan C. Sanders

MONACO, SANDERS, RACINE, & POWELL, L.L.C.
8700 State Line Road, Suite 110

Leawood, Kansas 66206

Main: (816) 523-2400, ext. 2

Direct dial: (816) 209-6837

Fax: (816) 942-0006

dsanders@kcattorneys.net

This message is from the offices of Monaco, Sanders, Racine & Powell, L.C. and is intended only for the addressee. The information
contained in this message is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside or non-public information under
federal or state securities laws and is intended only for the use of the addressee. Unauthorized forwarding, printing, copying,
distributing, or using of such information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you are not the addressee, please promptly

delete this message and notify the sender of the delivery error by return e-mail or you may call us at (816) 523-2400.

From: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 29, 2023 2:45 PM

To: Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>; leslie@byramlaw.com; Jon A. Blongewicz
<blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>; Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net>
Subject: Re: Thomas Price G&C

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=e4499aae07 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1783932425173918054&simpl=msg-f:17839324251739180...  2/7
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If I don't have a contact or phone number or name of an insurance company, I don't know what you think I
am going to do about it.

David C. Kirk
8000 Foster
Overland Park, KS 66204

Mailing:

P.O. Box 13304

Overland Park, KS 66282

913 940-7600

Fax: 913 642-5860

E-Mail: dkirk121@yahoo.com

If you are not the intended recipient of this email, the sender requests that you destroy this email.

[Quoted text hidden]

Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net> Wed, Nov 29, 2023 at 2:52 PM

To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>

From: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 29, 2023 2:52 PM

To: Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>; leslie@byramlaw.com; Jon A. Blongewicz
<blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>; Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net>
Subject: Re: Thomas Price G&C

Someone probably has his insurance cards.

I know it's not me.

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=e4499aae07&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1783932425173918054&simpl=msg-f:17839324251739180...

3/7



3/14/24,12:18 PM Gmail - RE: Thomas Price G&C

Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net> Wed, Nov 29, 2023 at 2:56 PM
To: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>, Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>, "leslie@byramlaw.com"
<leslie@byramlaw.com>, "Jon A. Blongewicz" <blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>

| don’t have them either, | only met and spoke with Tom Price once briefly at the beginning of mediation. |
can see what | can find out though as to where his insurance cards are. Seems Like a good place to start.

Dan C. Sanders

MONACO, SANDERS, RACINE, & POWELL, L.L.C.
8700 State Line Road, Suite 110

Leawood, Kansas 66206

Main: (816) 523-2400, ext. 2

Direct dial: (816) 209-6837

Fax: (816) 942-0006

dsanders@kcattorneys.net

This message is from the offices of Monaco, Sanders, Racine & Powell, L.C. and is intended only for the addressee. The information
contained in this message is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside or non-public information under
federal or state securities laws and is intended only for the use of the addressee. Unauthorized forwarding, printing, copying,
distributing, or using of such information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you are not the addressee, please promptly

delete this message and notify the sender of the delivery error by return e-mail or you may call us at (816) 523-2400.

From: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 29, 2023 2:52 PM

To: Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>; leslie@byramlaw.com; Jon A. Blongewicz
<blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>; Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net>
Subject: Re: Thomas Price G&C

Someone probably has his insurance cards.

I know it's not me.

David C. Kirk

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=e4499aae07 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1783932425173918054&simpl=msg-f:17839324251739180...  4/7
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[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net> Wed, Nov 29, 2023 at 2:56 PM
To: Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>, "leslie@byramlaw.com" <leslie@byramlaw.com>, "Jon A. Blongewicz"
<blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>, David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>

Thx. Michelle.

Dan C. Sanders

MONACO, SANDERS, RACINE, & POWELL, L.L.C.
8700 State Line Road, Suite 110

Leawood, Kansas 66206

Main: (816) 523-2400, ext. 2

Direct dial: (816) 209-6837

Fax: (816) 942-0006

dsanders@kcattorneys.net

This message is from the offices of Monaco, Sanders, Racine & Powell, L.C. and is intended only for the addressee.
The information contained in this message is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside or
non-public information under federal or state securities laws and is intended only for the use of the addressee.
Unauthorized forwarding, printing, copying, distributing, or using of such information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful. If you are not the addressee, please promptly delete this message and notify the sender of the delivery error

by return e-mail or you may call us at (816) 523-2400.

From: Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 29, 2023 2:55 PM

To: leslie@byramlaw.com; Jon A. Blongewicz <blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>; Dan C. Sanders
<dsanders@kcattorneys.net>; David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>

Subject: Re: Thomas Price G&C

I'm with Terri. She has an insurance card for 2022 she is showing me. I'll email it after the hearing.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=e4499aae07 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1783932425173918054&simpl=msg-f:17839324251739180...  5/7
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From: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 29, 2023 2:51 PM

To: Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>; leslie@byramlaw.com <leslie@byramlaw.com>; Jon A.
Blongewicz <blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>; Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net>
Subject: Re: Thomas Price G&C

Someone probably has his insurance cards.

| know it's not me.

David C. Kirk

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net> Fri, Dec 1, 2023 at 9:41 AM
To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>

Jeff-

| got your text message. | spoke with Gary yesterday regarding his request that account be moved from
Edward Jones. | spoke with Jon afterwards and he has no problem. | called Kirk several times re same. |
have called Michelle as well to see if they are all in agreement. Waiting to hear back.

Dan C. Sanders

MONACO, SANDERS, RACINE, & POWELL, L.L.C.
8700 State Line Road, Suite 110

Leawood, Kansas 66206

Main: (816) 523-2400, ext. 2

Direct dial: (816) 209-6837

Fax: (816) 942-0006

dsanders@kcattorneys.net

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=e4499aae07 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1783932425173918054&simpl=msg-f:17839324251739180...  6/7
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This message is from the offices of Monaco, Sanders, Racine & Powell, L.C. and is intended only for the addressee. The information
contained in this message is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside or non-public information under
federal or state securities laws and is intended only for the use of the addressee. Unauthorized forwarding, printing, copying,
distributing, or using of such information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you are not the addressee, please promptly

delete this message and notify the sender of the delivery error by return e-mail or you may call us at (816) 523-2400.

[Quoted text hidden]

Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com> Fri, Dec 1, 2023 at 1:38 PM
To: Amy Lucinda Julo <amyj1966@att.net>

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Dan C. Sanders" <dsanders@kcattorneys.net>
Date: December 1, 2023 at 9:41:36 AM CST

To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Thomas Price G&C

[Quoted text hidden]
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